
 

 

                               ONGOING FROM 

                                           2023  

-------------------------------------------------------- 

    Total Budget 

     BDT 16,76,762 
 

------------------------------------------------------------- 
                                  No. of Beneficiary  

                           137 cont. 
------------------------------------------------------------------- 
         
 

Funded BY:  

 

------------------------------------------------------------- 
Area Coverage: 

3 district 
( Jashore, Satkhira, Faridpur) 

 

 

  

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

   

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

                             

 

 

Financial inclusion Improves sanitation and health    

(finish Mondial) 
 

At a Glance 
 Rural Reconstruction Foundation, in partnership with 

WASTE, Netherlands, is collaborating on the "Financial 
Inclusion Improves Sanitation & Health" project. This 
initiative aims to establish integrated and sustainable 
WASH (Water, Sanitation, and Hygiene) and waste 
management services by encouraging private sector 
participation. Finish Mondial is a global program 
which is being implemented simultaneously in 6 
countries of the world including Bangladesh. 
The goal is to sustainably add 10,000,000 people 
worldwide by 2025 among the workforce 
Involvement in sanitation. The project focuses on 
developing businesses related to safe sanitation and 
solid waste management while promoting an inclusive 
management system. It involves social business 
organizations, informal workers, and cooperatives in 
the waste and sanitation sectors. The project's 
comprehensive approach encompasses the entire 
waste management value chain—from generation to 
ultimate disposal—aligning with the municipality's 
goals of providing efficient waste collection, sanitation 
services, and ensuring a clean, green, safe, and 
climate-resilient city. 


